

**Fort Bend County Tabulation  
Bid 21-090**

**Helicopter Sustainment Project for Homeland Security and Emergency Management**

**Awarded 07/06/21: Lowest Bidder per Section**

**Funding: Homeland Security Grant Program/SWAT/Helicopter Sustainment**

Description	Quantity	Churchill Navigation dba Shotover Systems Boulder, CO	Macro Blue Inc. Moorpark, CA	Temple Electronics Company, Inc. Arcola, TX		Wescam USA, Inc. Santa Rosa, CA
				Unit Price	Extended Total	
10.1 WESCAM MX-10 Camera/Imager 19WUSA172 for EO/IR System	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		\$403,788.00
10.2 Meeker Nose Mount for 10.1	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$19,000.00	\$19,000.00	No Bid
10.3 MB12W Q-series Display, P/N: MB12W - N33142XIO and MB10.65W Q-series Display, P/N: MB10W - N33142XIO	1	No Bid	\$25,930.00	No Bid		No Bid
10.4 Radio and Traffic FM Transceiver and Audio IN9100 Product	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$56,345.00	\$56,345.00	No Bid
10.5 Churchill Augmented Reality Mapping System (ATOM) ARS-700C Mission Computer for use with Wescam MX-IO including CONN-ATOM	1	\$137,000.00	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
10.6 Chin Bubbles for Bell OH58	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,753.00	\$3,506.00	No Bid
10.7 Skytrax Automatic Dependent Surveillance Broadcast (ADS-B) in Traffic Systems and Weather (WX)	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,853.00	\$5,706.00	No Bid
10.8 New LED landing lights for front landing tube	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
10.9.1 Installation only of Section 10.1/ WESCAM MX-10	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	No Bid
10.9.2 Installation only of Section 10.2/ meeker nose mount	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$4,000.00	\$4,000.00	No Bid
10.9.3 Installation only of Section 10.3/ MB12W and MB1065W	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,600.00	\$2,600.00	No Bid
10.9.4 Installation only of Section 10.4/ Radio and Traffic FM transceiver and Audio IN9100	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$11,400.00	\$11,400.00	No Bid
10.9.5 Installation only of Section 10.5/ Churchill Mapping System	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$14,000.00	\$14,000.00	No Bid
10.9.6 Installation only of Section 10.6/ two (2) Chin Bubbles	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$4,000.00	\$8,000.00	No Bid

Description	Quantity	Churchill Navigation dba Shotover Systems Boulder, CO	Macro Blue Inc. Moorpark, CA	Temple Electronics Company, Inc. Arcola, TX		Wescam USA, Inc. Santa Rosa, CA
				Unit Price	Extended Total	
10.9.7 Installation only of Section 10.7/ two (2) Skytrax Automatic Dependent Surveillance Broadcast (ADSB) in Traffic Systems and Weather (WX) on two (2) separate aircrafts and connect to currently installed Avidyne 540's	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$5,000.00	\$10,000.00	No Bid
10.9.8 Installation only of Section 10.8/ two (2) New LED landing lights on front landing tube:	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$3,600.00	\$7,200.00	No Bid
10.9.9 Installation only of one (1) Davtron provided by County	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,600.00	\$1,600.00	No Bid
10.9.10 Engineering Drawings and Supplemental Type Certificates required	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$9,000.00	\$9,000.00	No Bid