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Section 1: Surgical Supplies Lawson 
Number

Manufacturer                    
Name

Manufacturer                
Number

Vendor's Item 
Number

Substitutes 
are only 

allowed for 
each item 

stating              
Yes.              

Unit Item 
is 

Delivered/ 
Invoiced 

by       
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Carton, 

                     

Quantity           
in              
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(Case, 

Box, Pkg, 
Carton, 
Ea, etc.)                    

Estimated 
Annual 
Number   

of            
Units 

Purchased

 WA Butler 
Company dba 

Covetrus North 
America/Butler 
Animal Health 
Supply, LLC, 
Dublin, OH 

 Intervet Inc./ 
Merck Animal 

Health,            
Omaha, NE 

Scalpel blades, #15, Box of 100 14368 P L Medical 04341 Yes Box 100 80 10.90$                No Bid

4-0 suture, Polydioxanone, taper point, 
Box of 12

14369 CP Medical Corp 10195 Yes Box 12 15 68.86$                

4-0 suture, Polydioxanone, reverse 
cutting, Box of 12

14370 CP Medical Corp 10195 Yes Box 12 15 54.57$                

3-0 suture, Polydioxanone, taper point, 
Box of 12

14371 CP Medical Corp 10195 Yes Box 12 60 49.62$                

3-0 suture, Polydioxanone, reverse 
cutting, Box of 12

14372 CP Medical Corp 10195 Yes Box 12 60 53.99$                

2-0 suture, Polydioxanone, taper point, 
Box of 12

14375 CP Medical Corp 10195 Yes Box 12 30 53.99$                

2-0 suture, Polydioxanone, reverse 
cutting, Box of 12

14373 CP Medical Corp 10195 Yes Box 12 30 53.34$                

0 suture, Polydioxanone, taper point, 
Box of 12

14376 CP Medical Corp 10195 Yes Box 12 30 68.86$                

0 suture, Polydioxanone, reverse cutting, 
Box of 12

14374 CP Medical Corp 10195 Yes Box 12 30 54.51$                

Fort Bend County Tabulation
Bid 21-072

Medical Supplies for Animal Services

TERM:  through March 31, 2022

Awarded 7/27/21:  Low Bidder per Item
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Section 1: Surgical Supplies (cont'd) Lawson 
Number

Manufacturer                    
Name

Manufacturer                
Number

Vendor's Item 
Number

Substitutes 
are only 
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stating              
Yes.              
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 WA Butler 
Company dba 

Covetrus North 
America/Butler 
Animal Health 
Supply, LLC 

 Intervet Inc./ 
Merck Animal 

Health 

Surgical drape, Disposable, 38"x100yd 14377 Jorgensen Labs 00282 2345- Box 1 15 81.14$                No Bid

Surgical gloves, Encore Micro, size 6.5, 
Box of 50

14378 Ansell Perry 00525 5787002 Box 50 7 54.77$                

Surgical gloves, Encore Sensi-Touch, 
size 6.5, Box of 50

14379 Ansell Perry 00525 7823PF Box 50 7 31.15$                

Surgical gloves, Encore Textured, size 
6.5, Box of 50

14380 Ansell Perry 00525 5785002 Box 50 7 54.98$                

Surgical gloves, Encore Style 42, size 
6.5, Box of 50

14381 Ansell Perry 00525 5711102PF Box 50 7 36.60$                

Surgical gloves, Dynarex, size 6.5, Box 
of 50

14382 Dynarex 05635 2365 Box 50 7 40.90$                

Surgical gloves, Krutex, size 6.5, Box of 14383 Kruuse 26106 261230 Box 50 7 47.50$                
Surgical gloves, Krutex Vet-Gel, size 
6.5, Box of 50

14385 Kruuse Box 50 7 No Bid

Surgical masks, Ear loop, Box of 50 14384 26640 2800938 Yes Box 50 20 26.00$                
Autoclave pouch, 5.25 x 10", self-
sealing, 200 count

14386 Crosstex 06718 SCM Yes Box 200 3 24.68$                

Autoclave pouch, 5.25 x 10", self-
  

14387 Cardinal Health 00282 92510 Yes Box 200 3 64.30$                
Autoclave pouch, 7.5 x 13", self-sealing, 
200 count

14388 Medical Action 
Industries

06718 SCM Yes Box 200 5 24.68$                

Autoclave pouch, 7.5 x 13", self-sealing, 
200 count

14389 Crosstex 06718 SCL Yes Box 200 5 45.42$                

Autoclave pouch, 7.5 x 13", self-sealing, 
200 count

14390 Cardinal Health 00282 92713 Yes Box 200 5 36.70$                

Autoclave pouch, 13 x 7&3/8", self-
sealing, 200ct

14391 Jorgensen Labs 00414 J0480C Yes Box 200 5 62.50$                

Autoclave indicator tape, 3/4", 60yd 14392 Intco Medical 26960 AUTOCLAVETAPE
3/4

Yes Each 1 2 1.76$                  

Gauze, nonwoven, 2x2", 200 count 14393 Dukal Ccorp 55016 1019278 Yes Pack 200 35 0.81$                  

Gauze, nonwoven, 3x3", 200 count 14394 Zhende Medical (HK) 
CO., Limited

26640 M4147.57.50C53-26 Yes Pack 200 35 1.62$                  

Gauze, nonwoven, 4x4", 200 count 14395 Zhende Medical (HK) 
CO., Limited

26640 M41410100C53-36 Yes Pack 200 35 2.53$                  
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Section 1: Surgical Supplies (cont'd) Lawson 
Number

Manufacturer                    
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Manufacturer                
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Covetrus North 
America/Butler 
Animal Health 
Supply, LLC 

 Intervet Inc./ 
Merck Animal 

Health 

Chlorhexidine solution 2%, 1 gallon 14396 First Priority 02077 CH020CV Yes Gallon 1 8 6.35$                  No Bid
Chlorhexidine scrub 4%, 1 gallon 14397 First Priority 02077 CH011CV Yes Gallon 1 8 24.35$                
Surgical hand antiseptic, Avagard, 
500mL 

14398 3M 00472 9321A Yes Each 1 2 11.48$                

Isoflurane, 250mL 14399 Piramal Critical Care 08871 11695067772 Yes Bottle 1 45 20.49$                

Anesthesia gas filter canister 14400 Dee Veterinary 
Products  

05984 7000 Yes Each 1 45 6.34$                  

Sodasorb/Carbolime, 5 gallon/37 pound 14401 Midmark 12975 002-1765-00 Yes Bucket 1 1 97.86$                

Eye lubricant, Optixcare Eye Lube, 20g 14402 Aventix 17258 OPX-4242 Yes Tube 1 20 8.49$                  

Eye lubricant, Optixcare Eye Lube Plus, 
20g

14403 Aventix 17258 OPX-4242 Yes Tube 1 20 8.49$                  

Clipper blade, #40, Ultra Edge, stainless 
steel

14404 Andis 03337 64076 Each 1 3 23.71$                

Surgical glue, 2mL 14405 Covetrus 10195 GLU-CA1999-BUT Bottle 1 30 8.59$                  
Surgical glue, 3mL 14406 3M 00472 1469SB Bottle 1 10 14.39$                
Tattoo ink paste, green, 1oz 14407 00414 J0276PGS Yes Tube 1 1 7.50$                  
Tilzolan, Tiletamine/zolazepam, 
100mg/mL, 5mL vial

14408 Dechra 15022 VINV-CIII-0009 Vial 1 5 55.30$                

Zoletil, Tiletamine/zolazepam, 
100mg/mL, 5mL vial

14409 Jurox 15022 VINV-CIII-0012 Vial 1 5 58.01$                

Butorphanol , 10mg/mL, 50mL 14410 Bayer Vial 1 1
Butorphanol , 10mg/mL, 50mL 14411 Merck 00195 017070 Vial 1 1 179.93$              
Buprenorphine, 0.3mg/mL, 5x1mL 14412 Generic 55030 42023017905 Box 5 5 74.74$                
Dexmedetomidine, 0.5mg/mL, 10mL 14413 Dechra 15022 VINV-DEXM-0510 Vial 1 10 141.88$              
Atipamezole, 5mg/mL, 10mL 14414 15022 VINV-MODE-022U Vial 1 1 146.97$              
Ketamine, 100mg/mL, 25x10mL 14418 00821 11695-6840-1 Box 25 1 140.04$              
Ketamine, 100mg/mL, 10mL 14416 07823 10004027 Vial 1 1 14.55$                
Midazolam, 5mg/mL, 10x10mL 14417 17971 23155060142 Box 10 1 46.42$                
Propofol, 10mg/mL, 5x20mL 14419 23090 11695-2800-1 Box 5 1 29.17$                
Xylazine, 100mg/mL, 50mL 11420 Covetrus 03742 1XYL006 Vial 1 1 20.29$                
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Section 2: Special Surgical Lawson 
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Covetrus North 
America/Butler 
Animal Health 
Supply, LLC 

 Intervet Inc./ 
Merck Animal 

Health 

Telazol, Tiletamine/zolazepam, 
100mg/mL, 5mL vial

14423 Zoetis 07823 10004135 Vial 1 8 72.80$                No Bid

Butorphanol, 10mg/mL, 50mL 14424 Zoetis 07823 10009984 Vial 1 3 189.30$              
Dexmedetomidine, 0.5mg/mL, 10mL 14425 Zoetis 07823 10002752 Vial 1 10 190.35$              
Antisedan, 5mg/mL, 10mL 14426 Zoetis 07823 10000449 Vial 1 1 210.70$              
Propoflo 28, 10mg/mL, 5x20mL 14427 Zoetis 07823 10014546 Box 5 2 72.75$                
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America/Butler 
Animal Health 
Supply, LLC 
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Merck Animal 

Health 

Carprofen, 25mg tablets, 180ct 14428 Norbrook Labs 04983 6451970845 Yes Bottle 180 4 55.55$                No Bid
Carprofen, 75mg tablets, 180ct 14429 Norbrook Labs 04983 6452070845 Yes Bottle 180 6 69.51$                
Carprofen, 100mg tablets, 180ct 14430 Norbrook Labs 04983 6452170845 Yes Bottle 180 3 88.06$                
Gabapentin, 100mg capsules, 500ct 14431 Ascend Labs 12536 67877022205 Yes Bottle 500 3 12.75$                
Gabapentin, 300mg capsules, 500ct 14432 Top RX Inc 55054 02-15811 Yes Bottle 500 1 23.43$                
Meloxicam oral suspension, 1.5mg/mL, 
32mL

14433 Ceva Animal Health Inc 00205 C531032A Yes Box 1 2 27.46$                

Meloxicam injectable solution, 5mg/mL, 
10mL

14434 Norbrook Labs 04983 6451602845 Yes Vial 1 1 56.47$                

Meloxicam injectable solution, 5mg/mL, 
20mL

14435 Norbrook Labs 04983 6451603845 Yes Vial 1 1 103.41$              

Carprofen injectable solution, 50mg/mL, 
20mL

14436 Vedco Inc 15022 VINV-CAR5-2102 Yes Vial 1 3 65.40$                

Rimadyl injectable solution, 50mg/mL, 
20mL

14437 Zoetis 07823 10000319 Yes Vial 1 5 133.70$              

Cephalexin, 250mg capsules, 500ct 14438 Lupin Pharmaceuticals 12332 68180012102 Yes Bottle 500 1 36.77$                
Cephalexin, 500mg capsules, 500ct 14439 Lupin Pharmaceuticals 12332 68180012202 Yes Bottle 500 1 48.23$                
Cefpodoxime, 100mg tablets, 100ct 14440 Cronus Pharma 23085 69043000601 Yes Bottle 100 3 37.73$                
Cefpodoxime, 200mg tablets, 100ct 14441 Cronus Pharma 23085 69043000701 Yes Bottle 100 4 74.63$                
Amoxicillin, 250mg capsules, 500ct 14442 Bloodworth Wholesale 10124 00781202005 Yes Bottle 500 2 22.37$                

Amoxicillin, 500mg capsules, 500ct 14443 Bloodworth Wholesale 10124 00781261305 Yes Bottle 500 2 25.75$                

Amoxicillin oral suspension, 50mg/mL, 
15mL

14444 Zoetis Inc. 07823 10000475 Yes Bottle 1 24 5.75$                  

Clavacillin, 62.5mg tablets, 210ct 14445 Vedco Inc 15022 VINV-CLV4-4021 Yes Box 210 1 64.01$                
Clavacillin, 125mg tablets, 210ct 14446 Vedco Inc 15022 VINV-CLV4-4121 Yes Box 210 1 118.61$              
Clavacillin, 250mg tablets, 210ct 14447 Vedco Inc 15022 VINV-CLV4-4221 Yes Box 210 1 195.34$              
Clavacillin, 375mg tablets, 210ct 14448 Vedco Inc 15022 VINV-CLV4-4321 Yes Box 210 1 279.11$              
Metronidazole, 250mg tablets, 500ct 14449 Amici Pharmaceuticals 26141 69292020750 Yes Bottle 500 1 23.13$                

Metronidazole, 500mg tablets, 100ct 14450 Amici Pharmaceuticals 26141 69292020850 Yes Bottle 100 1 38.60$                

Doxycycline, 100mg tablets, 500ct 14451 Epic Pharma LLC 26163 42806031205 Yes Bottle 500 2 31.25$                
Doxycycline , 100mg capsules, 500ct 14452 Chartwell RX 28691 62135098505 Yes Bottle 500 1 47.20$                
Clindamycin, 75mg capsules, 100ct 14453 Micro Labs USA 26140 42571025001 Yes Bottle 100 1 43.99$                
Clindamycin, 150mg capsules, 100ct 14454 Cardinal Health 107 17726 3388063 Yes Bottle 100 1 8.09$                  
Clindamycin, 300mg capsules, 100ct 14455 Cronus Pharma 23085 69043001601 Yes Bottle 100 1 17.43$                
Clindamycin oral solution, 25mg/mL, 
20mL

14456 First Prioity 02077 OM090CV Yes Bottle 1 2 2.35$                  
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Section 3: Pharmacy (cont'd) Lawson 
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Supply, LLC 
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Health 

Azithromycin, 250mg tablets, 30ct 14457 Top RX Inc 55054 02-12250 Yes Bottle 30 1 12.71$                No Bid
Azithromycin oral suspension, 
40mg/mL, 30mL

14458 Epic Pharma LLC 26163 42806015134 Yes Bottle 1 12 6.54$                  

Famciclovir, 125mg tablets, 30ct 14459 Bloodworth Wholesale 10124 31722070630 Yes Bottle 30 4 13.16$                

Famciclovir, 250mg tablets, 30ct 14460 Camber 
Pharmaceuticals

12158 3172270730 Yes Bottle 30 1 11.03$                

Famciclovir, 500mg tablets, 30ct 14461 Cardinal Health 107 17726 4812673 Yes Bottle 30 1 23.22$                
Itrafungol suspension, 52mL 14462 Elanco 15022 VINV-VC01-1605 Bottle 1 25 38.40$                
Ketoconazole, 200mg tablets, 100ct 14463 Taro 

PharmaceuticalsUSA 
55040 51672402601 Yes Bottle 100 2 77.03$                

Terbinafine, 250mg tablets, 100ct 14464 Cardinal Health 107 17726 5259247 Yes Bottle 100 4 13.97$                
Prednisone, 10mg tablets, 100ct 14465 Novitium Pharma 28491 70954005920 Yes Bottle 100 1 64.64$                
Prednisone, 20mg tablets, 100ct 14466 Novitium Pharma 28491 70954006010 Yes Bottle 100 1 9.17$                  
Dexamethasone injectable, 2mg/mL, 
100mL

14470 Bimeda Animal Health 03742 1DEX022 Yes Vial 1 1 5.34$                  

Diphenhydramine injectable, 50mg/mL, 
10mL 

14471 Capital Wholesale Drug 
Co.

00329 701241 Yes Vial 1 1 13.25$                

Diphenhydramine, 25mg tablets, 100ct 14469 Capital Wholesale Drug 
Co.

00329 347978 Yes Bottle 100 10 1.66$                  

Endosorb tablets, 500ct 14472 PRN Pharmacal, Inc 01431 30030251 Yes Bottle 500 1 76.73$                
Propectalin paste, 30mL, each 14474 Vetoquinol USA Inc 00187 410816 Yes Each 1 10 13.96$                
ProViable capsules, 80ct 14475 Nutramax Laboratories 26101 PROVDC80 Yes Box 80 10 29.99$                

Ivermectin for injection, 1% solution, 
50mL

14476 Vedco Inc 15022 VINV-NORB-7000 Yes Vial 1 1 20.27$                

Propylene glycol, 1 gallon 14477 First Priority 02077 MS100PC Yes Bottle 1 1 39.63$                
Nutrical, 5oz 14478 Ampharmco 01348 158 Yes Each 1 3 3.13$                  
Pill wrap, 4oz jar 14479 Vetoquinol 00187 429022 Yes Jar 1 45 8.27$                  
Pyrantel, 50mg/mL suspension, 1L 14480 Neogen Corp 01165 09072 Yes Bottle 1 6 15.57$                
Panacur, 10% suspension, 1L 14481 Merck Animal Health 00195 069267 Yes Bottle 1 3 127.34$              
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Section 4: Special Pharmacy Lawson 
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Animal Health 
Supply, LLC 

 Intervet Inc./ 
Merck Animal 

Health 

Rimadyl injectable solution, 50mg/mL, 
20mL

14482 Zoetis 07823 10000319 Bottle 1 7 133.70$              No Bid

Convenia, 10mL 14483 Zoetis 07823 10001498 Bottle 1 6 339.75$              
Clavamox oral suspension, 15mL 14485 Zoetis 26655 72508020410 Bottle 1 12 38.42$                
Cerenia injectable, 30mL 14484 Zoetis 07823 10002396 Bottle 1 8 171.90$              
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Section 5: Clinic supplies Lawson 
Number
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America/Butler 
Animal Health 
Supply, LLC 

 Intervet Inc./ 
Merck Animal 

Health 

Isopropyl alcohol, 70%, 16oz 14486 First Priority 02077 MS071CV Yes Bottle 16 12 2.58$                  No Bid
Isopropyl alcohol, 70%, 32oz 14487 First Priority 02077 MS073CV Yes Bottle 32 12 3.86$                  
Isopropyl alcohol, 70%, 1 gallon 14488 BLENDING 

TECHNOLOGIES
01371 ALCOHOL 70% PVL 

GAL
Yes Bottle 1 20 17.87$                

Hydrogen peroxide, 3%, 1 gallon 14490 First Priority 02077 MS160CV Yes Bottle 1 3 3.62$                  
Instrument detergent, Multi-enzyme 
concentrate, 1 gallon

14489 Covetrus 03309 838701000360 Yes Bottle 1 2 40.85$                

Instrument lubricant, 1 gallon 14491 Integra Miltex 00456 3-710 Yes Bottle 1 2 30.12$                
Rescue AHP, Liquid disinfectant 
concentrate, 1 gallon

14492 Clipper Distributing Co 
LLC

95031 Yes Bottle 1 12 35.60$                

Rescue AHP, Liquid disinfectant 
concentrate, 55 gallon

14493 Clipper Distributing Co 
LLC

95031 Yes Barrel 1 2 1,474.34$           

Rescue AHP, Liquid disinfectant 
concentrate, 4 x 55 gallon

14494 Clipper Distributing Co 
LLC

95031 Yes Barrel 4 1 5,966.30$           

Rescue AHP, Ready-to-use wipes, 160ct 
tub

14495 Clipper Distributing Co 
LLC

95031 Yes Tub 1 6 12.83$                

Plastic bottle, With yorker, 1/4oz, 60ct 14496 D & D Wholesale 
Supply

05965 Yes Bag 60 3 14.84$                

Plastic bottle, With yorker, 1/2oz, 48ct 14497 D & D Wholesale 
Supply

05965 Yes Bag 48 3 11.35$                

Plastic bottle, With yorker, 1oz, 24ct 14498 D & D Wholesale 
Supply

05965 Yes Bag 24 2 6.90$                  

Plastic bottle, With yorker, 2oz, 12ct 14499 D & D Wholesale 
Supply

05965 Yes Bag 12 2 3.85$                  

IV catheter, 24G x 0.75", Sur-Vet 
Surflo, each

14500 Vedco Inc 15022 Yes Each 1 15 1.22$                  

IV catheter, 22G x 1", Sur-Vet Surflo, 
each

14501 Vedco Inc 15022 Yes Each 1 20 1.22$                  

IV catheter, 20G x 1.25", Sur-Vet 
Surflo, each

14502 Vedco Inc 15022 Yes Each 1 30 1.72$                  

IV catheter, 18G x 1.25", Sur-Vet 
Surflo, each

14503 Vedco Inc 15022 Yes Each 1 50 1.72$                  

IV injection plug, Luer lock, each 14504 ICU Medical 10143 Yes Each 1 150 1.70$                  
IV admin set, each, Luer lock, 
15drop/mL, 78", each

14505 Amsino International 30012 Yes Each 1 50 17.00$                

Sterile empty vial, 30mL, 25 vials 14506 Fresenius Kabi LLC 10096 Yes Tray 25 3 71.45$                
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Section 5: Clinic supplies (cont'd) Lawson 
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Merck Animal 

Health 

Insulin syringes, U100, 0.5mL, 1/2" 
needle, Box of 100

14507 Ultimed Inc 10140 7260 Yes Box 100 75 22.96$                No Bid

Insulin syringes, U100, 1mL, 1/2" 
needle, Box of 100

14508 Ultimed Inc 10140 7261 Yes Box 100 5 29.78$                

Syringes, 1mL, without needle, 100ct 14509 Jiangsu Caina Medical 
Co. LTD

23620 81701003 Yes Box 100 10 8.19$                  

Syringes, 1mL, 25G x 5/8" needle, soft 
pack, 100ct

14510 Shangai Kindly 
Enterprise Dev Grp

23637 9004459 Yes Box 100 5 8.00$                  

Syringes, 1mL, 25G x 5/8" needle, hard 
pack, 100ct

14511 Jiangsu Caina Medical 
Co. LTD

23620 81701001 Yes Box 100 5 13.95$                

Syringes , 3mL, 22G x 1" needle, soft 
pack, 100ct

14512 Jiangsu Caina Medical 
Co. LTD

23620 1127340 Yes Box 100 30 5.13$                  

Syringes, 3mL, 22G x 1" needle, hard 
pack, 100ct

14513 Jiangsu Caina Medical 
Co. LTD

23620 81707002 Yes Box 100 30 10.51$                

Syringes, 12mL, 100ct 14514 Jiangsu Caina Medical 
Co. LTD

23620 9004476 Yes Box 100 2 9.45$                  

Syringes, 20mL, regular tip, 50ct 14515 Shangai Kindly 
Enterprise Dev Grp

23637 1126151 Yes Box 50 1 12.50$                

Syringes, 20mL, eccentric tip, 50ct 14516 Shangai Kindly 
Enterprise Dev Grp

23637 1127349 Yes Box 50 1 12.50$                

Syringes, 35mL, 30ct 14520 Cardinal Health 00282 8881535796 Yes Box 30 1 19.24$                
Syringes, 35mL, 50ct 14518 Shangai Kindly 

Enterprise Dev Grp
23637 1127354 Yes Box 50 1 14.28$                

Syringes, 60mL, 20ct 14519 Cardinal Health 00282 8881560224 Yes Box 20 1 20.00$                
Needles, 25G x 5/8", soft pack, 100ct 14521 Shangai Kindly 

Enterprise Dev Grp
23637 9004468 Yes Box 100 5 3.10$                  

Needles, 25G x 5/8", hard pack, 100ct 14522 Jiangsu Caina Medical 
Co. LTD

23620 80301013 Yes Box 100 5 5.56$                  

Needles, 22G x 1", soft pack, 100ct 14523 Shangai Kindly 
Enterprise Dev Grp

23637 1127107 Yes Box 100 6 3.10$                  

Needles, 22G x 1", hard pack, 100ct 14526 Jiangsu Caina Medical 
Co. LTD

23620 80301012 Yes Box 100 6 5.56$                  

Needles, 20G x 1", soft pack, 100ct 14524 Shangai Kindly 
Enterprise Dev Grp

23637 1127109 Yes Box 100 5 3.10$                  

Needles, 20G x 1", hard pack, 100ct 14527 Jiangsu Caina Medical 
Co. LTD

23620 80301009 Yes Box 100 5 5.56$                  

Needles, 18G x 1", soft pack, 100ct 14525 Shangai Kindly 
Enterprise Dev Grp

23637 9004469 Yes Box 100 6 3.10$                  

Needles, 18G x 1", hard pack, 100ct 14528 Jiangsu Caina Medical 
Co. LTD

23620 80301005 Yes Box 100 6 5.56$                  
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Health 

Exam gloves, Latex, small, 100ct 14529 Dynarex Corp 05635 BA-017468 Yes Box 100 50 9.26$                  No Bid
Exam gloves, Latex, polymer-coated, 
small, 100ct 

14530 SRI Trang Gloves 
(Thailand) Co LTD

25458 7023424 Yes Box 100 50 8.59$                  

Exam gloves, Latex, chlorinated, small, 
100ct 

14533 SRI Trang Gloves 
(Thailand) Co LTD

25458 7023429 Yes Box 100 50 11.21$                

Exam gloves, Latex, medium, 100ct 14536 Dynarex Corp 05635 BA-017470 Yes Box 100 50 9.26$                  
Exam gloves, Latex, polymer-coated, 
medium, 100ct 

14531 SRI Trang Gloves 
(Thailand) Co LTD

25458 7023425 Yes Box 100 50 10.85$                

Exam gloves, Latex, chlorinated, 
medium, 100ct 

14534 SRI Trang Gloves 
(Thailand) Co LTD

25458 7023430 Yes Box 100 50 11.21$                

Exam gloves, Latex, large, 100ct 14537 Dynarex Corp 05635 BA-017471 Yes Box 100 20 9.35$                  
Exam gloves, Latex, polymer-coated, 
large, 100ct 

14532 SRI Trang Gloves 
(Thailand) Co LTD

25458 7023426 Yes Box 100 20 10.85$                

Exam gloves, Latex, chlorinated, large, 
100ct 

14535 SRI Trang Gloves 
(Thailand) Co LTD

25458 7023431 Yes Box 100 20 11.21$                

Exam gloves, Nitrile, small, 100ct 14538 SRI Trang Gloves 
(Thailand) Co LTD

25458 7023434 Yes Box 100 10 15.50$                

Exam gloves, Nitrile, medium, 100ct 14539 SRI Trang Gloves 
(Thailand) Co LTD

25458 7023435 Yes Box 100 10 15.50$                

Exam gloves, Nitrile, large, 100ct 14540 SRI Trang Gloves 
(Thailand) Co LTD

25458 7023436 Yes Box 100 10 15.50$                

Terramycin ophthalmic oint., 1/8oz 14541 Zoetis Inc 07823 10000474 Yes Tube 1 20 14.85$                
Tobramycin ophthalmic drops, 0.3%, 
5mL

14542 Akorn Inc 00821 0404-7196-01 Yes Bottle 1 5 2.74$                  

Erythromycin ophthalmic oint., 0.5%, 
3.5g

14543 Akorn Inc 00821 17478007035 Yes Tube 1 5 9.78$                  

NeoPolyBac ophthalmic oint., 
Neomycin, Polymyxin, Bacitracin, 3.5g

14544 Bausch Health US, 
LLC

01164 24208078055 Yes Tube 1 10 4.83$                  

NeoPolyDex ophthalmic drops, 
Neomycin, Polymyxin, Dexamethasone, 

14546 Bausch Health US, 
LLC

01164 24208083060 Yes Bottle 1 3 5.28$                  

NeoPolyDex ophthalmic oint., 
Neomycin, Polymyxin, Dexamethasone, 

14545 Bausch Health US, 
LLC

01164 24208079535 Yes Tube 1 3 4.57$                  

Gentamicin ophthalmic drops, 0.3%, 
5mL

14547 Akorn Inc 00821 59399010105 Yes Bottle 1 3 3.15$                  

Ofloxacin ophthalmic drops, 0.3%, 5mL 14548 Yes Bottle 1 5 No Bid

Ofloxacin ophthalmic drops, 0.3%, 
10mL

14549 Yes Bottle 1 5 No Bid
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Section 6: Intake Lawson 
Number
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 WA Butler 
Company dba 

Covetrus North 
America/Butler 
Animal Health 
Supply, LLC 

 Intervet Inc./ 
Merck Animal 

Health 

Rabies, Defensor 1, 5 x 10 doses, 50 
doses

14550 Nobivac 65441 Yes Tray 50 50 167.00$              58.00$                

Rabies, Defensor 1, 50 x 1 dose, 50 
doses

14551 Zoetis 10016542 Yes Tray 50 50 167.50$              No Bid

FVRCP, Felocell 3, 25 dose tray 14552 Nobivac 65264 Yes Tray 25 40 162.50$              49.50$                
FVRCP-C, Felocell 4, 25 dose tray 14553 Nobivac 65266 Yes Tray 25 40 188.75$              63.75$                
DHPP, Vanguard Plus 5, 25 dose tray 14554 Nobivac 65288 Yes Tray 25 80 200.00$              74.75$                
DHLPP, Vanguard Plus 5 L4, 25 dose 
tray

14555 Nobivac 99336 Yes Tray 25 40 298.75$              104.75$              

DHPP-C, Vanguard Plus 5 / CV, 25 
dose tray

14556 Nobivac 65289 Yes Tray 25 10 308.75$              119.25$              

Bordetella, Vanguard Rapid Resp 2 
syringe-free, 25 dose tray

14557 Nobivac 54215 Yes Tray 25 60 173.75$              76.75$                

Bordetella, Vanguard Rapid Resp 3 
syringe-free, 25 dose tray

14558 Nobivac 65316 Yes Tray 25 60 173.75$              76.75$                

Revolution, Canine, 85-130#, 30 doses 14559 Nobivac 153307 Yes Case 30 1 576.00$              300.00$              
Simparica, 2.8-5.5#, 60 doses 14560 Zoetis 10012457 Yes Case 60 2 579.50$              600.00$              
Simparica, 5.6-11#, 60 doses 14561 Zoetis 10012458 Yes Case 60 3 589.00$              600.00$              
Simparica, 11-22#, 60 doses 14562 Bravecto 151483 Yes Case 60 3 600.50$              600.00$              
Simparica, 22-44#, 60 doses 14563 Bravecto 158128 Yes Case 60 11 650.00$              600.00$              
Simparica, 44-88#, 60 doses 14564 Bravecto 158345 Yes Case 60 11 669.00$              600.00$              
Simparica, 88-132#, 60 doses 14565 Bravecto 153307 Yes Case 60 3 678.50$              600.00$              



12

Section 7: Canine diagnostics Lawson 
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America/Butler 
Animal Health 
Supply, LLC 

 Intervet Inc./ 
Merck Animal 

Health 

Heartworm test, Anigen CHW Test, 
100ct 

14566 Vedco 15022 VINV-MODE-0005 Yes Box 100 12 325.00$              No Bid

Parvo test, Canine Parvovirus Antigen 
Test, 10ct

14567 Zoetis 07823 10023170 Yes Box 10 8 158.95$              

Section 8: Feline diagnostics Lawson 
Number

Manufacturer                    
Name

Manufacturer                
Number

Vendor's Item 
Number

Substitutes 
are only 

allowed for 
each item 

stating              
Yes.              

Unit Item 
is 

Delivered/ 
Invoiced 

by       
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 WA Butler 
Company dba 

Covetrus North 
America/Butler 
Animal Health 
Supply, LLC 

 Intervet Inc./ 
Merck Animal 

Health 

Heartworm test, Vetscan Canine/Feline 
Antigen, 100ct 

14568 Zoetis 07823 10023168 Yes Box 100 1 318.00$              No Bid

Parvo test, Parvovirus Antigen Test, 
10ct

14569 Zoetis 07823 10023170 Yes Box 10 1 158.95$              

Parvo test, Parvovirus Antigen Test, 
20ct

14570 Zoetis 07823 10023171 Yes Box 20 1 296.65$              

Parvo test, Parvovirus Antigen Test, 5ct 14571 Zoetis 07823 10012674 Yes Box 5 1 84.80$                

FeLV/FIV test, Vetscan FeLV/FIV 
Antibodies, 25ct

14572 Zoetis 07823 10023176 Yes Box 25 30 397.50$              
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