Fort Bend County Tabulation

RFQ 2017-08
Dumpster Rental

Term: 1 October 2016 through 30 September 2017

Awarded to: Republic Services

Dumpster Once a Week Service and Monthly Rental Fee

Dumpster Size Location Lawson # Estimated| WCA Waste Corporation Sprint Waste Republic Services Nexus Disposal
and Annual
Description Quantity [ Monthly Rental | Extended | Monthly Rental| Extended | Monthly Rental [ Extended Monthly Rental Extended
and Price and Price and Price and Price
Servicing Price Servicing Price Servicing Price Servicing Price
Front load, 4 |Katy Branch
yard 2620 Commercial Center
Blvd. Katy TX 77494 5954 12 $75 | $  900.00 NO BID $ 79.46 953.52 | $ 85.80 | $ 1,029.60
Front load, 6 |North End Annex
yard 22333 Grand Corner Dr.
Katy Texas 77494 9421 12 $92 [ $ 1,104.00 NO BID $ 86.00 1,032.00 NO BID
Front load, 4  |First Colony Branch
yard 2121 Austin Pkway
Sugarland, Texas 77479 12753 12 NO BID NO BID $ 101.61 1,219.32 NO BID
Front load, 4  |Sugar Land Branch
yard 550 Eldridge Road
Sugar Land, Texas 12754 12 NO BID NO BID $ 101.61 1,219.32 NO BID
Front load, 4  |University Branch
yard 14010 University Blvd
Sugarland, Texas 77479 | 12755 12 NO BID NO BID $ 101.61 1,219.32 NO BID
Front load, 2  |Albert George Branch
yard 9230 Gene Street
Needville TX 77461 9424 12 $73 | $ 876.00 NO BID $ 37.64 451.68 | $ 75771 $ 909.24
Front load, 6  |Parks Department
yard 2725 F.M. 521 North
Fresno TX 77545 5961 12 $95 | $ 1,140.00 NO BID $ 86.00 1,032.00 | $ 11261 | $ 135132
2 each - Crabb Service Center
Front load, 8  |201 Payne Lane/FM 762
yard Richmond TX 77469 5962 12 $218 [ $ 2,616.00 NO BID $ 110.00 1,320.00 | $ 24437 | $ 2,932.44
Front load, 4 |Road & Bridge
yard 4310 FM 2218
Richmond TX 77469 9868 12 NO BID NO BID $ 79.46 95352 | $ 9742 | $ 1,169.04
Frontload, 4 |jones Creek Ranch
yard Park 7714 FM 359 S
Richmond TX 77469 11408 12 $75]| $ 900.00 NO BID $ 79.46 95352 | $ 9562 | $ 1,147.44




Front load, 6  |Juvenile Leadership
yard 400 Coen Road
Rosharon TX 9718 12 $103 [ $ 1,236.00 NO BID $ 86.00 | $ 1,032.00|$ 113.66 | $ 1,363.92
Front load, 2  [Mamie George Branch
yard 320 Dulles Avenue
Stafford TX 77477 5958 12 $65| $ 780.00 NO BID $ 3764 | $ 451.68 NO BID
Front load, 6  [5th Street Community
yard Center
3110 Fifth Street
Stafford Texas 77477 8786 12 $95 | $ 1,140.00 NO BID $ 86.00 | $ 1,032.00 | $ 11156 [ $ 1,338.72
Front load, 8  |Four Corners Park
yard **(September-April)**
15700 Old Richmond Road
Stafford TX 77477
5960 8 $102 [ $ 816.00 NO BID $ 110.00 | $ 880.00 | $ 139.42 | $ 1,115.36
Dumpster - Monthly Rental Fee For Bi-Weekly Service
Dumpster Size Location Estimated| WCA Waste Corporation Republic Services Nexus Disposal
and Annual Sprint Waste
Description Lawson # Quantity
Monthly Rental | Extended | Monthly Rental | Extended | Monthly Rental| Extended Monthly Rental Extended
and Price and Price and Price and Price
Front load, 8  |Four Corners Park
yard **(May-August)**
15700 Old Richmond Road
Stafford TX 77477 5964 4 $187.00] $ 748.00 NO BID $ 110.00 | $ 440.00 | $ 27885 $ 1,115.40
Roll off, 40 Crabb Service Center
yard 201 Payne Lane/FM 762
Richmond TX 77469
5965 12 $355.00| $ 4,260.00 | $ 380.00 | $ 4,560.00 | $ 399.00 | $ 4,7838.00 | $ 500.00 [ $ 6,000.00
Roll off, 40 Beechnut Office
yard 19310 Beechnut
Richmond TX 77469 5966 12 $355.00] $ 4,260.00 | $ 380.00 | $ 4,560.00 | $ 399.00 | $ 4,7838.00 | $ 500.00 [ $ 6,000.00
Total per month for all locations:| $ 1,890.00 $ 760.00 $ 2,090.49 $ 2,355.08
Annual Total:| $20,776.00 | Annual Total: | $ 9,120.00 | Annual Total: | $ 23,765.88 Annual Total: [ $ 25,472.48
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